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Preface

The present study aims at assessing the current level of economic activity/
development, in the state of Jammu and Kashmir and attempts a road map for future
development. The topography of the state, the regional diversity, the fragile ecology,
the centuries-old traditions of arts and crafts – these are the factors which make the
state distinct and different from other states of the Union. The ongoing militancy has
indeed impacted the pace and progress of development during the previous decade
or so.

The surge in information technology, and the bio-tech revolution underway in some
of the states seem to have bypassed the state of Jammu and Kashmir. The rising rate
of unemployment, and overwhelming dependence of educated youth on Government
employment indeed make the situation complex and difficult. The need is to have
some “out-of box” thinking in working out economic nostrums for the state. Because
of its climate, and ready availability of skilled and educated manpower, the state is
ideally suited for sunrise industries like information technology and bio-technology.

The current study indicates directions and initiatives which are employment oriented,
and the accomplishment of which is possible within a short time-frame or horizon.

The study is the result of team-effort undertaken under the umbrella of the Institute
of Social Sciences, New Delhi. The Department of Management Studies, Kashmir
University has been an important partner in this study. I would like to acknowledge
with thanks the help and assistance extended by Kashmir University under the
stewardship of Dr. A.M. Shah, Head of Management Studies Department. Prof. M.
Aslam of Indira Gandhi National Open University has contributed substantially in
this study and his help and guidance have been invaluable and outstanding. The
officers of various departments in the state government offered their unstinted
support and assistance to the research team. Dr. Jacob John has extended his
valuable suggestions which have improved the report. I also thank Mr. P.
Nandakumar who has typed the draft and formatted the final report. Finally, my
grateful thanks to Dr. George Mathew, Director, Institute of Social Sciences and his
team of researchers who worked very hard in bringing out the study.
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